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Past Conference Report

We would like to thank all of our wonderful keynotes, speakers, 
conference attendees, students, associations, media partners, 
exhibitors and guests for making Public Health 2018 a successful 
event.

Conference Series llc LTD hosted the 4th World Congress on 
Public Health and Nutrition during February 25-26, 2019 at 
Golden Tulip Berlin - Hotel Hamburg Berlin, Germany with 
the theme “Discovering new ways to ameliorate Global Health”. 
Benevolent response and active participation was received 
from the Editorial Board Members of supporting International 
Journals as well as from the leading academic scientists, 
researchers, research scholars, students and leaders from the 
fields of Public Health and Nutrition, who made this event 
successful.

The conference was marked by the attendance of young and 
brilliant researchers, business delegates and talented student 
communities representing more than 18 countries, who have 
driven this event into the path of success. The conference 
highlighted through various sessions on current retroviral 
research.

Public Health 2019 witnessed an amalgamation of peerless 
speakers who enlightened the crowd with their knowledge and 
confabulated on various new-fangled topics related to the fields 
of Public Health and Nutrition.

The meeting was carried out through various sessions, in which 
the discussions were held on the following major scientific 
tracks:

Public Health and Epidemiology

Community Nutrition

Occupational Health

Nursing

Mental Health

Healthcare Management

Obesity and Health Risks

Adolescent Health

Nutritional Health

Cardiovascular Diseases

Health and Community Nutrition

Non-Communicable Diseases

The conference proceedings were carried out through various 
Scientific-sessions and plenary lectures. The conference was 
embarked with an opening ceremony followed by a series of 
lectures delivered by both Honorable Guests and members of 
the Keynote forum. The adepts who promulgated the theme 
with their exquisite talk were;

Giulio Barocco, Azienda Sanitaria Universitaria Integrata di 
Trieste, Italy

Hiroshi Yamada University of Shizuok, Japan

Francois-Xavier Frapaise F.-X. Frapaise Consulting, France

Raul Zamora-Ros Bellvitge Biomedical Research Institute | 
Spain

Andre Preissler Loureiro Chaves Independent Researcher | 
Brazil

Neeraj Agrawal AIIMS Patna | India

 

The event enlightened various arenas of Health Economics, with 
plenary lectures from the speakers of various universities and 
organizations like

Azienda Sanitaria Universitaria Integrata di Trieste, Italy

Mukorgawa Women’s University, Japan

University of Copenhagen, Denmark

Howard University, USA

Kobe International University, Japan

Seoul National University, South Korea

Saratov State University, Russia

Sakhnin College, Israel

HENRY, National Charity, UK

University of Valencia, Spain

Ministry of Health, Portugal

Seonam University of Medicine, South Korea

Lebanese University, Lebanon

VIA University College, Denmark

Kyungbok University, South Korea
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Mayo Institute of Medical Sciences, India

University of Venda, South Africa

Jhpiego, India

Inha University, South Korea

King Abdulaziz University, Saudi Arabia

Massey University, New Zealand

The University of Zambia, Zambia

Eagle Matrix Consulting Co. Ltd, Japan

University of Calgary in Qatar, Qatar

Hamad General Hospital, Qatar

Kanagawa Center for Clinical Research and Strategy, Japan

Beirut Arab University, Lebanon

Pontificia Bolivariana University, Colombia

Holy spirit University of Kaslik, Lebanon

General Board of Global Ministries, Zimbabwe

Thaksin University, Indonesia

The University of Queensland, Australia

The Australian Colleague of Physical Education, Australia

Maseno University, Kenya

Massey University, New Zealand

FASSCO International PTE, United Arab Emirates

Najran University, Saudi Arabia

Maseno University, Kenya

Public Authority for Applied Education and Training, Kuwait

World Health Organization, Zambia

Jawaharlal Nehru University, India

Eastern Mediterranean University, Cyprus

King George’s Medical University, India

University of East London, United Kingdom

JSS Medical College, India

University of Oslo, Norway

We are also obliged to various delegate experts, company 
representatives and other eminent personalities who supported 
the conference by facilitating active discussion forums. We 
sincerely thank the Organizing Committee Members for their 
gracious presence, support, and assistance towards the success 
of Public Health 2019.

With the grand success of Public Health and Nutrition-2019, 
ConferenceSeries llc LTD is proud to announce the "5th World 
Congress on Public Health and Nutrition” to be held during 
February 24-25, 2020 in London, UK

For more information please visit:  https://publichealth.
healthconferences.org/
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