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Abstract:
The Open Dialogue Approach is both a community-based 
and social network-oriented treatment system offered to 
persons in psychic crises and their families, which follows 
certain guidelines as e.g. immediate help, which is given 
in a flexible and mobile way, and a special therapeutic 
attitude with a way of communication with the patients 
and their families.The essential elements of this commu-
nication have to be trained, which may take place as an 
in house-training or within a series of workshops visited 
by members of different institutions.Though these train-
ing groups are usually multiprofessionally composed, so 
that participants of different backgrounds learn together, 
the importance of considering psychiatric nurses in these 
trainings has to be pointed out: as one of the characteris-
tics of the ODA consists of its non-hierarchical attitude, 
so trained nurses usually enjoy an improved position in 
their team, respectively in the contact with patients and 
their families, experiencing themselves as more compe-
tent and interested in the contexts of crises.This process 
will be illustrated by the example of the feedback to a 
questioning carried out with psychiatric nurses after an 
in house-training in a psychiatric hospital in Berlin.
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