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Abstract:
Initial hypothesis: We have been witnessed and still are 
of numerous discussions among experts (scientists) and 
layman people about the efficiency and harmfulness of 
vaccines, especially MMR vaccines which was considered 
and still is thatit causes autism. Research goal: Determine 
the coverage of mandatory immunization, especially the 
MMR vaccine, in the Pomoravlje district. Research meth-
odology: The research was conducted at the Public Health 
Institute in Cuprija from 03.09.- 20.09.2018. The period 
from 01.01.2016.- 31.12.2016. As an research instrument 
I used documentation sheet, observation, analysis and a 
survey. Findings: there are variations in the percentage 
of vaccinated children from certain vaccines in certain 
towns in the Pomoravlje district, but the overall percent-
age of vaccines is satisfying in the district. Conclusion: 
Although mass media and social networks (where people 
have access to a great deal of information) have raised a 
great deal of concern about the correctness of the MMR 
vaccine, as well as others that may have unintended con-
sequences, the number of vaccinated MMR vaccines is 
satisfying and it’s not below 91% for each town in the 
district.
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